
Memorandum #08-11 
 
To:  Al Viereck, Interim City Manager 

From:  Johns Jonas, Utility Director 

Subject: Bid Recommendation – ANNUAL SUPPLY OF WATER METERS for 2008 

Date:  January 17, 2008 

 
              
 
Three (3) suppliers submitted bids on January 15 for the annual supply of water meters as summarized on the 

attached bid tabulation.  The prices for the ¾” and 1” are in line with what the City has had in the past.  The 2” 

and larger meters have seen a substantial increase.  At the present time, the Water Department uses 350 to 400 

new meters annually between new construction and meter replacement.   Sixty-five thousand dollars ($65,000) 

is budgeted in 2008 for meters and radio frequency meter interface units.  

 
It is recommended that the bid be awarded to the low bidders as shown below: 
 
New Meters Outright Price     Name - Low Bidder   Unit Price 

1. 5/8” x 5/8” x 7 1/2” Meters    DSG Dakota Supply Group  $    69.07 
2. 5/8” x 3/4” x 7 1/2” Meters    DSG Dakota Supply Group  $    69.07 
3. 3/4” x 3/4” x 9” Meters    DSG Dakota Supply Group  $    90.83 
4. 1” x 1” x 10 3/4” Meters    DSG Dakota Supply Group  $  122.55 
5. Neptune R900 (Radio Frequency Meter Interface Unit) Northern Water Works  $    90.00 
6. 1 1/2” Meter 2 Bolt Flange Disc/Piston 13” Length DSG Dakota Supply Group  $  286.93 
7. 2” Meter 2 Bolt Flange Turbine 10” Length  Northern Water Works  $  437.51 
8. 3” Meter 4 Bolt Flange Turbine 12” Length  DSG Dakota Supply Group  $  601.05 
9. 4” Meter 8 Bolt Flange Turbine 14” Length  DSG Dakota Supply Group  $  904.53 
 

New Meters Exchange Price    Name – Low Bidder   Unit Price 
1. 5/8” x 5/8” x 7 1/2” Meters    DSG Dakota Supply Group  $    67.71 
2. 5/8” x 3/4” x 7 1/2” Meters    DSG Dakota Supply Group  $    67.71 
3. 3/4” x 3/4” x 9” Meters    DSG Dakota Supply Group  $    88.96 
4. 1” x 1” x 10 3/4” Meters    HD Supply Waterworks  $  114.00 
5. 1 1/2” Meter 2 Bolt Flange Disc/Piston 13” Length DSG Dakota Supply Group  $  281.56 
6. 2” Meter 2 Bolt Flange Turbine 10” Length  DSG Dakota Supply Group  $  516.18 
7. 3” Meter 4 Bolt Flange Turbine 12” Length  DSG Dakota Supply Group  $  582.21 
8. 4” Meter 8 Bolt Flange Turbine 14” Length  DSG Dakota Supply Group  $  872.88 

 

 
Respectfully submitted, 
 
 
John Jonas 
Utilities Director 



Recommendation:  It is recommended that the City Commission approve Memorandum #08-11 awarding 

the bid for the 2008 Annual Supply of Water Meters to above named low bidders for each items listed. 

 
_____ I concur with this recommendation. 

 
_____ I do not concur with this recommendation. 

 
 
              
      Al Viereck – Interim City Manager  
 
 
 
Attachment 
 
cc: Kevin Kuhl PE, Director of Public Works 



City of Yankton  •  PO Box 176  •  Yankton, SD 57078  •  Phone: 605-668-5251  •  Fax: 605-668-5265

Name
5/8" x 3/4" x 7 1/2"

Meters

3/4" x 3/4" x 9"

Meters

1" x 1" x 10 3/4"

Meters

Neptune R900 Radio 

Frequency Meter Interface 

Unit

1 1/2" Meter

2 Bolt Flange Disc or

Piston 13" in Length

2" Meter

2 Bolt Flange Turbine

10" in length

3" Meter

4 Bolt Flange Turbine

12" in Length

4" Meter

8 Bolt Flange Turbine

14" in Length

Prior Years Prices $70.00 $103.00 $154.00 $80.00 $280.00 $390.00 $579.00 $1,061.00

DSG Dakota Supply Group

ATTN: Pat B

1409 N K Ave

Sioux Falls, SD 57104

$69.07 $90.83 $122.55 No Bid $286.93 $525.18 $601.05 $904.53

Northern Water Works

ATTN: Vannie Rugroden

1694 91st Avenue Northeast

Blaine, MN 55449

$80.59 $122.36 $173.58 $90.00 $343.13 $437.51 $712.50 $1,156.25

HD Supply Waterworks

ATTN: Tim Monson

2101 E 54th Street North

Sioux Falls, SD 57104

$85.00$85.00$85.00$85.00 $110.00$110.00$110.00$110.00 $140.00$140.00$140.00$140.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

DSG Dakota Supply Group

ATTN: Pat B

1409 N K Ave

Sioux Falls, SD 57104

$67.71 $88.96 $118.65 $281.56 $516.18 $582.21 $872.88

Northern Water Works

ATTN: Vannie Rugroden

1694 91st Avenue Northeast

Blaine, MN 55449

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

HD Supply Waterworks

ATTN: Tim Monson

2101 E 54th Street North

Sioux Falls, SD 57104

$68.00 $89.00 $114.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$67.71

No Bid

$68.00

$85.00

New Meters Exchange Price for 2008

 =    Low Bid Outright

 =    Low Bid Exchange

ANNUAL SUPPLY OF WATER METERS for 2008
Bid Opening Janurary 15, 2008 at 3:00 P.M. • Project #2008-001

5/8" x 5/8" x 7 1/2"

Meters

$69.07

$80.59

New Meters Outright Price for 2008

$70.00

1/23/2008


